
Notice: Any comments made after 5:00 p.m. on the Thursday before the 
Council Meeting will not be seen in the agenda packet. 

Purpose: ☐ FYI

☐ Read and Comment as Needed

☐ Action Required by May 20, 2024
☐ In Confidential File Drawer

Approve: 

Johnny Boker  Yes  No  No Comment
Comment:  

Casi Boyer  Yes  No  No Comment
Comment: 

Vicki Jones  Yes  No  No Comment
Comment:  

Jim Ringsaker  Yes  No  No Comment
Comment:  

Jason Robertson  Yes  No  No Comment
Comment:  

Tammy Lynn 
Schneegas  Yes  No  No Comment
Comment:  

Note: N/A 

CITY COUNCIL 
READ FILE COVER SHEET 

Subject:  Ordinance 1151 concerning Repealing and Replacing 
                Chapter 31 Building Construction

(Public Hearing & 2nd Reading)

Date:  5/7/2024



Ordinance No. 1151 

1 Ordinance No. 1151 

T. Bourcier – 4/22/2024 

CITY COUNCIL 1 

OF 2 

HAVRE DE GRACE, MARYLAND 3 

 4 

ORDINANCE NO. 1151 5 

 6 

 7 

Introduced by    Council Member Schneegas       8 

 9 

 10 

AN ORDINANCE BY THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL OF 11 

HAVRE DE GRACE, MARYLAND, ADOPTED PURSUANT TO THE 12 

AUTHORITY OF ARTICLE XI-E OF THE MARYLAND 13 

CONSTITUTION, THE LOCAL GOVERNMENT ARTICLE OF THE 14 

ANNOTATED CODE OF MARYLAND, AND SECTIONS 33 AND 34 15 

OF THE HAVRE DE GRACE CITY CHARTER TO REPEAL AND 16 

REPLACE HAVRE DE GRACE CITY CODE CHAPTER 31 17 

BUILDING CONSTRUCTION 18 

 19 

 20 

On:  May 6, 2024  21 

at:   7:00 p.m.  22 

Ordinance introduced, read first time, ordered posted and public hearing scheduled. 23 

 24 

 25 

PUBLIC HEARING 26 

A Public Hearing is scheduled for  May 20, 2024 at 7:00 p.m.  27 

 28 

 29 

 30 
EXPLANATION 

Underlining indicates matter 

added to existing law. 

[Bold Brackets] indicate matter 

deleted from existing law. 

Amendments proposed prior to 

final adoption will be noted on a 

separate page with line 

references or by handwritten 

changes on the draft legislation. 

 31 

  32 



Ordinance No. 1151 

2 Ordinance No. 1151 

T. Bourcier – 4/22/2024 

 WHEREAS, the Mayor and City Council of Havre de Grace (“City”) adopted Ordinance 33 

1030 on March, 16, 2020 and codified the 2018 versions of the International Property Maintenance 34 

Code, International Building Code, and the International Residential Code for one- and two-family 35 

dwellings, along with the general savings clause and violation provisions; and 36 

 37 

 WHEREAS, the City has determined that the 2021 versions of the International Property 38 

Maintenance Code, International Building Code, International Residential Code for One and Two-39 

family Dwellings, and International Energy Conservation Code should replace the current Codes, 40 

and that the Code Violations Costs should be retained. 41 

 42 

 NOW THEREFORE, the Mayor and City Council ordain, establish and enact the 43 

following Ordinance as follows: 44 

 45 

Article I 46 

PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE 47 

 48 

A). Section 31-1. Adoption of International Property Maintenance Code 2021. 49 

 50 

 The International Property Maintenance Code 2021 as published by the 51 

International Code Council Inc., Chapters 1 through 8, copies of which are on file with 52 

the Department of Planning of the City of Havre de Grace, is hereby adopted by the 53 

Mayor and City Council of the City of Havre de Grace, Maryland for the purpose of 54 

protecting the health, safety and welfare of the citizens of the City of Havre de Grace. 55 

 56 

B).  Section 31-2. Amendments. 57 

 58 

 The International Property Maintenance Code 2021 shall be adopted with the 59 

following amendments: 60 

 61 

A. The name of the jurisdiction in the second line of Section 101.1, Title, on page 1 of 62 

the International Property Maintenance Code 2021 shall be “The Mayor and City 63 

Council of Havre de Grace referenced herein as the City of Havre de Grace”. 64 

 65 

B.  Section 102.3, Application of other codes, shall read: “Repairs, additions or alterations 66 

to a structure, or changes of occupancy, shall be done in accordance with the 67 

procedures and provisions of the International Building Code 2021, the 68 

International Residential Code 2021, the City of Havre de Grace Zoning Ordinance, 69 

and applicable codes of Harford County, Maryland, and the State of Maryland.” 70 

 71 

C.  Section 103.1, General, shall read: “The Director of the Department of Planning, or the 72 

Director's designee, to be known as the Code Official is hereby designated as the 73 

administrative official in charge of the implementation and enforcement of the 74 

International Property Maintenance Code 2021.” 75 

 76 

D.  Section 103.2, Appointment, shall be deleted. 77 

 78 



Ordinance No. 1151 

3 Ordinance No. 1151 

T. Bourcier – 4/22/2024 

E.  Section 103.3, Deputies, shall be deleted. 79 

 80 

F.  Section 104.1, Fees, shall read: “The fees for activities and services performed by the 81 

Department in carrying out its responsibilities under the International Property 82 

Maintenance Code 2021 shall be based upon the valuation of staff time required to 83 

complete plan and permit examinations, site inspections and enforcement activity 84 

and shall be established by the Mayor and City Council from time to time.” 85 

 86 

G.  Section 105.6, Department records, shall read: “An official record shall be kept of all 87 

business and activities of the Department specified in the provisions of the 88 

International Property Maintenance Code 2021, and all such records shall be open 89 

to public inspection at all appropriate times and according to reasonable rules to 90 

maintain the integrity, confidentiality, and security of such records.” 91 

 92 

H.  New Section 105.8, Restriction of employees, shall be added as follows: “An official 93 

or employee connected with the Department of Planning shall not be engaged in or 94 

directly or indirectly connected with the furnishing of labor, materials or appliances 95 

for the construction, alteration or maintenance of a building, or the preparation of 96 

construction documents thereof, unless that person is the owner of the building; nor 97 

shall such officer or employee engage in any work that conflicts with official duties 98 

or with the interests of the Department.” 99 

 100 

I.  Section 107.1, General, shall read: “All appeals of orders, decisions or determinations 101 

made by the Code Official shall be heard by the Board of Appeals, per Chapter 25 102 

of the City Code.” 103 

 104 

J.  Section 108, Board of Appeals, is to be removed. 105 

 106 

K.  Section 109.3, Prosecution of violation, shall read: 107 

 108 

1) Any person who shall be adjudged to have (1) violated any of the provisions of this 109 

ordinance; or (2) failed to comply herewith or permitted or maintained such a violation; or 110 

(3) violated or failed to comply with any order made hereunder; or (4) built in violation of 111 

any details, statements, specifications or plans submitted or approved hereunder; or (5) 112 

failed to operate in accordance with the provisions of any certificate, permit, or approval 113 

issued hereunder shall, severally for each violation and noncompliance respectively, be 114 

guilty of a municipal infraction, for which a fine not to exceed $1,000 may be imposed for 115 

each such infraction, payable to the City of Havre de Grace, with costs imposed in the 116 

discretion of the court.  Each day that an infraction continues after notice has been served 117 

shall be deemed a separate infraction.  The imposition of a fine for any violation shall not 118 

excuse the violation, nor shall the violation be permitted to continue.  Prosecution or lack 119 

thereof of either the owner, occupant, or the person in charge shall not be deemed to relieve 120 

any of the others. 121 

 122 

2) Any person who shall be convicted of willfully (1) violating any of the provisions of this 123 

ordinance; or (2) failing to comply herewith or permitting or maintaining such a violation; 124 



Ordinance No. 1151 

4 Ordinance No. 1151 

T. Bourcier – 4/22/2024 

or (3) violating or failing to comply with any order made hereunder; or (4) building in 125 

violation of any details, statements, specifications or plans submitted or approved 126 

hereunder; or (5) failing to operate in accordance with the provisions of any certificate, 127 

permit, or approval issued hereunder shall, severally for each violation and noncompliance 128 

respectively, be guilty of a misdemeanor, punishable by a fine of not more than $1,000 and 129 

imprisonment not exceeding 90 days for each violation, with costs imposed in the 130 

discretion of the court.  Each day that a violation continues after notice has been served 131 

shall be deemed a separate offense. The imposition of punishment for any violation shall 132 

not excuse the violation, nor shall the violation be permitted to continue.  Prosecution or 133 

lack thereof of either the owner, occupant, or the person in charge shall not be deemed to 134 

relieve any of the others. 135 

 136 

3) Any order or notice issued or served as provided in this ordinance shall be complied with 137 

by the owner, operator, occupant or other person responsible for the condition or violation 138 

to which the order or notice pertains. Every order or notice shall set forth a time limit for 139 

compliance dependent upon the hazard and danger created by the violation.  In cases of 140 

extreme danger to persons or property, immediate compliance shall be required.  If the 141 

notice of violation is not complied with, the Code Official shall institute the appropriate 142 

proceeding at law or in equity to restrain, correct or abate such violation, or to require the 143 

removal or termination of the unlawful occupancy of the structure in violation of the 144 

provisions of this code or of the order or direction made pursuant thereto. 145 

 146 

4) In addition to the other provisions set out in this ordinance, the City of Havre de Grace may 147 

institute injunctive, declaratory or any other appropriate action or proceedings at law or 148 

equity for the enforcement of this ordinance or to correct violations of the International 149 

Property Maintenance Code 2021, and any court of competent jurisdiction has the right to 150 

issue restraining orders, temporary or permanent injunctions or mandamus or other 151 

appropriate forms of remedy or relief. 152 

 153 

5) All provisions of Section 6-102 of the Local Government Article of the Annotated Code 154 

of Maryland relating to municipal infractions are incorporated in this chapter. In the event 155 

of any inconsistency between this Section 106.3 and Section 6-102 of the Local 156 

Government Article, the provisions in Section 6-102, shall prevail. 157 

 158 

L.  Section 109.4, Violation penalties, shall be deleted. 159 

 160 

M.  Section 109.5, Abatement of violation: Add a second sentence which shall read as 161 

follows: “Any costs associated with any action taken by the authority having 162 

jurisdiction on such premises shall be charged against the real estate upon which 163 

the structure is located and may be recovered as a lien upon such real estate.  Costs 164 

shall also include City inspection fees and reasonable attorneys’ fees.” 165 

 166 

N.  Section 111.4.2: At the end of the section, the following exception shall be added: 167 

“Exception: Notice of violations requiring immediate attention will be 168 

conspicuously posted on the premises and allow up to five days to abate the 169 

violations.  Such notice shall be used for overgrown grass and/or weeds, untagged 170 



Ordinance No. 1151 

5 Ordinance No. 1151 

T. Bourcier – 4/22/2024 

or unregistered vehicles, trash and rubbish removal, snow removal, or other 171 

violations which require immediate attention.” 172 

 173 

O.  Section 113 General shall read: “The Code Official shall order the owner, or owner’s 174 

authorized agent, of any premises upon which is located any structure, which in the 175 

Code Official’s judgment is so deteriorated or dilapidated or has become so out of 176 

repair as to be dangerous, unsafe, insanitary or otherwise unfit for human habitation 177 

or occupancy, and such that it is unreasonable to repair the structure, to demolish 178 

and remove such structure.  If such structure is capable of being made safe by 179 

repairs, to repair and make safe and sanitary, or to board up and hold for future 180 

repair, or to demolish and remove at the owner’s option.  Boarding the building for 181 

future repair shall not extend beyond 180 days, unless approved by the Code 182 

Official.” 183 

 184 

P.  New Section 113.1.1, Abatement of unsafe conditions, shall be added as follows: 185 

“Abatement failure by the owner of any premises upon which is located a structure 186 

posing an imminent danger to human life or the public welfare due to an unsafe 187 

condition, the Director or the Director’s designee shall cause the necessary work to 188 

be done to eliminate the condition, including, but not limited to, the demolition of 189 

the structure or structures. The Director or the Director’s designee shall cause to be 190 

published, for two weekly issues, in a county newspaper of record, notice setting 191 

forth the address of the building; a description of the real estate sufficient for its 192 

identification; a statement that the property is unsafe and constitutes an immediate 193 

and continuing hazard to the community; and a statement that the City intends to 194 

demolish same if the owner fails to do so. A person objecting to the proposed 195 

actions of the City may file an objection in an appropriate form in a court of 196 

competent jurisdiction. If the building is not demolished within 30 days of mailing 197 

notice to the owners of record, or within 30 days of the last day of publication of 198 

the notice in a county newspaper of record, whichever is later, the Director or the 199 

Director’ s designee shall have the power to demolish the structure or structures.” 200 

 201 

Q.  New Section 113.1.2, Creation of a tax lien, shall be added as follows: “There is created 202 

a tax lien on real property for monies expended, including reasonable attorney’s 203 

fees, by the City for the making safe of buildings or structures and/or abatement of 204 

other unsafe nuisances or conditions constituting a danger to the public health and 205 

safety. The amount of such lien shall be collected by the Director of Finance in the 206 

same manner as other City real estate taxes.” 207 

 208 

R.  Section 110.1, Authority, shall read: “Whenever the Code Official finds any work 209 

regulated by this code, or other building codes adopted by the local jurisdiction, 210 

being performed in a manner contrary to the provisions of these codes, or in a 211 

dangerous or unsafe manner, the Code Official is authorized to issue a stop-work 212 

order.” 213 

 214 



Ordinance No. 1151 

6 Ordinance No. 1151 

T. Bourcier – 4/22/2024 

S.  Section 110.4, Failure to comply: At the end of the section remove, “established by the 215 

authority having jurisdiction” and add:  “as determined by the Code Official not to 216 

exceed $1,000.” 217 

 218 

T.  Section 201.4: At the end of the section, the following language shall be added: “or as 219 

is interpreted by the Director of Planning or Code Official.” 220 

 221 

U.  Section 202, General Definitions, shall have added to it these additional definitions as 222 

follows: 223 

 224 

1) JUNK YARD. Any land or building licensed and used for abandonment, storage, keeping, 225 

collecting or baling of paper, rags, scrap metals, other scrap, discarded materials or junk 226 

for the purpose of abandonment, demolition, dismantling, storage, recycling or salvaging. 227 

Proper business licensing required. 228 

 229 

2) OPEN STORAGE AREAS. Property areas used for storage of materials that are related to 230 

the occupation of the property owner and/or lessee. 231 

 232 

3) SALVAGE YARDS. Property area upon which any person or business stores three or more 233 

wrecked vehicles outdoors for the purpose of dismantling or otherwise wrecking the 234 

vehicles to remove parts for sale or for use in an automotive repair or rebuilding business. 235 

Any auto salvage business must be properly licensed. 236 

 237 

4) SURFACE COAT. All exterior siding and millwork shall be scraped to a sound base and 238 

sanded smooth. Scraped and sanded areas shall have joints and cracks filled and shall be 239 

primed with exterior primer paint. Following this preparation, all exterior siding and 240 

millwork shall be painted with two coats of exterior quality paint. 241 

 242 

5) BICYCLES, BOAT TRAILERS, MOPEDS AND OTHER MOTOR VEHICLES. The 243 

same as the definitions provided under Title 11 of the Transportation Article of the 244 

Annotated Code of Maryland, as amended, respectively. 245 

 246 

6) BOATS. Every description of watercraft, including jet skis, wave-runners, or an ice boat 247 

that is used or capable of being used as a means of transportation on water or ice but does 248 

not include a seaplane, canoe, kayak, sculling boat, paddle board or similar recreational 249 

equipment. 250 

 251 

7) INOPERABLE. Unable to function in a manner or condition consistent with or similar to 252 

the design operation for which it was intended, regardless of modification. 253 

 254 

8) NOXIOUS MATTERS. Debris, garbage, junk, noxious odors, rubbish and trash; 255 

abandoned or inoperable bicycles, boats, boat trailers, mopeds or motor vehicles; 256 

abandoned appliances, furniture or parts thereof; and/or any other matter or condition as 257 

determined to be detrimental to the adjoining properties or the public health, safety, and 258 

welfare. 259 

 260 



Ordinance No. 1151 

7 Ordinance No. 1151 

T. Bourcier – 4/22/2024 

V.  New Section 301.3.1, Vacant structure maintenance, shall be added as follows: “All 261 

land or improved premises within the City shall be maintained as though said 262 

property were being used or occupied. Once vacated or abandoned, the exterior of 263 

any structure and surrounding premises must be maintained to the minimum 264 

standards required by this code. Except for any structure damaged by fire, flood or 265 

natural disaster, the City shall be notified prior to any boarding of windows and 266 

doors to secure the structure. Any boarding shall be done in a professional manner, 267 

and the materials used shall conform to the overall exterior appearance of the 268 

structure. Said structure, except for historic structures as defined by the City, shall 269 

be made habitable within three months, or the structure shall be considered in an 270 

unsafe condition and subject to the provisions of this chapter.  The Code Official 271 

shall have the authority to allow a structure damaged by fire, flood or any natural 272 

disaster to remain boarded and secure for a period of one year, at which such time 273 

the structure shall be made habitable or said structure shall be considered in an 274 

unsafe condition and subject to the provisions of this chapter.” 275 

 276 

W.  New Section 302.2.1, Drainage, general, shall be added as follows: “Stormwater, sump 277 

pumps, sanitary systems, and other water-supplied appliances shall not discharge 278 

in a manner that is detrimental to neighboring properties or creates a public 279 

nuisance.” 280 

 281 

X.  Section 302.3, Sidewalks and driveways: Add the following section at the end of the 282 

paragraph: “It shall be unlawful for any person, incorporated body, public 283 

institution or other corporation using or occupying in any manner, or for any 284 

purpose whatsoever, any house, store, shop, stable, or tenement of any kind, 285 

persons having charge of churches and public buildings of every description and of 286 

owners of unoccupied houses and unimproved lots, situated on any street in this 287 

City, to fail to remove and clear away, or cause to be removed and cleared away, 288 

the snow/ice from the foot pavements fronting the respective houses, stores, shops, 289 

stables, churches, buildings or lots so used, occupied or owned by them or under 290 

their charge within 24 hours after the end of any weather event resulting in snow or 291 

ice.” (See City Code § 190-38.) 292 

 293 

Y.  Section 302.4, Weeds: Add the language “10” after the words “in excess of” in the 294 

second line. Add the following after the third sentence: “Trees and shrubs located 295 

on private property shall not create a nuisance, shall not create a safety hazard to, 296 

and shall not impose on public safety or interfere with any structure on the subject 297 

premises or adjoining properties or public utilities. When any lot, lots, parcels or 298 

tracts of land abut on any public street, avenue, alley, lane, sidewalk or other public 299 

right-of-way, the owner, occupant, lessor, lessee, tenant and/or any person, firm or 300 

corporation in control of such lot, lots, parcels or tracts of land shall be required to 301 

maintain so much of the public right-of-way as lies between the curbline/surfaced 302 

edge of the right-of-way and property lines of such lots, parcels or tracts of land as 303 

are occupied by or used by such owner, occupant, lessor, lessee, tenant and/or any 304 

person, firm or corporation in control thereof.  This shall include maintenance to 305 

https://ecode360.com/8370267#8370267


Ordinance No. 1151 

8 Ordinance No. 1151 

T. Bourcier – 4/22/2024 

the center line of the unimproved alley by all owners of any abutting lots, parcels 306 

or tracts of land.” 307 

 308 

Z.  Section 302.7, Accessory structures, shall read: “All accessory structures, including but 309 

not limited to detached garages, storage buildings, fences and walls, shall be 310 

maintained structurally sound and in good repair.  Fences and walls shall be erected 311 

such that a finished side of the structure faces outward from the property on which 312 

it is constructed.” 313 

 314 

AA.  Section 302.8, Motor vehicles, is amended by adding the following to the end of the 315 

section: “One unregistered but otherwise operative vehicle and/or trailer, not within 316 

a building, is permitted to be stored on the premises for a period not to exceed six 317 

months.  The vehicle must belong to the current occupant or owner of the property.  318 

The owner or occupant must obtain a permit from the Department of Planning for 319 

the storage of the unregistered vehicle.  After six months, the vehicle must be 320 

registered or removed from the premises.” 321 

 322 

BB.  New Section 302.10, Storage of junk, boats, appliances and furniture, shall be added 323 

as follows: “It shall be unlawful for any owner, occupant, lessor, lessee, tenant 324 

and/or person, firm or corporation in control of any lot, lots, parcels or tracts of land 325 

within the City to permit any junk, trash, refuse, debris, piled brush and branches, 326 

unused construction materials, garbage, or rubbish; abandoned or inoperable 327 

bicycles, boats, boat trailers, mopeds, motor vehicle parts, i.e., batteries, tires, 328 

fenders, rims, etc., or abandoned appliances, equipment, or furniture to remain on 329 

any such lot, lots, parcels or tracts of land where the Department of Planning 330 

determines that such materials or items are dangerous, detrimental or cause a 331 

nuisance to the adjoining properties or the public health and safety and welfare of 332 

the City or are the nesting place for vermin. In the case of a boat, it must have a 333 

current registration; be situated upon a boat trailer that also has a current registration 334 

and is in operational condition. No boat(s) shall be stored on private property that 335 

has a hull registration size of 30 feet or greater without first obtaining a permit from 336 

the City. All permits for storage of boats 30 feet or greater shall be made, in writing, 337 

to the City's Director of Planning with a copy sent to the Director of Administration 338 

and Council President. All permits shall be valid for seasonal storage purposes and 339 

are renewable upon approval of subsequent letters of request. All requests must 340 

contain proof of current registration and are subject to inspection of the boat and 341 

property to ensure the boat has not become a nuisance or danger. Any denied or 342 

expired requests for permitted seasonal storage require removal of the boat from 343 

the property within 60 days. A boat may be placed on blocks or cribbing for not 344 

more than one year. A property owner shall not have more than two registered and 345 

tagged boats and/or boat trailers parked or stored on a property, unless the property 346 

owner is operating as a licensed boat storage or boat operations business in 347 

accordance with all applicable zoning and other applicable laws or the property 348 

owner holds a valid Maryland State Commercial Fishing or Crabbing License. 349 

Boats that are stored inside an approved enclosed structure are exempt from this 350 

section of the code.” 351 



Ordinance No. 1151 

9 Ordinance No. 1151 

T. Bourcier – 4/22/2024 

 352 

CC.  New Section 302.1, Temporary Storage Containers, shall be added as follows: “All 353 

temporary storage containers must be permitted per City Code.  Semi-truck trailers 354 

used to store goods and other similar containers may be deemed temporary storage 355 

per review by the Code Official.”  356 

 357 

DD.  New Section 302.12, Control of animal waste, shall be added as follows: “No owner 358 

of a dog, or other pet, shall allow it to soil, defile, defecate upon or commit any 359 

other nuisance upon any public property or private property. The pet owner must 360 

take immediate steps to eliminate any such nuisance, including feces caused by the 361 

animal, in an appropriate and sanitary manner. The owner or occupant shall not 362 

allow accumulation of animal feces on any property in their control.” 363 

 364 

EE.  Section 304.1, General, shall read: “The exterior of a structure shall be maintained in 365 

good repair, structurally sound and sanitary so as not to create a public nuisance or 366 

be detrimental to adjoining properties, or pose a threat to the public health, safety 367 

or welfare.” 368 

 369 

FF.  Section 304.3, Premises identification, shall have the following added to the end of 370 

the section: “in the case of structures with accessory apartments, all apartments with 371 

side or rear entrances, or multiple front entrances, must be clearly identified with 372 

their apartment number or letter, in addition to the premises address.” 373 

 374 

GG.  Section 304.14: The dates in the first line shall be “April 1” and “November 1,” 375 

respectively. 376 

 377 

HH.  New Section 304.20, Storage areas, shall be added as follows: “All open salvage 378 

yards and open storage areas shall be continuously completely obscured from 379 

surrounding property by a screened fence approved by the Director of Planning, not 380 

less than eight feet and not more than 10 feet in height and/or approved 381 

landscaping.” 382 

 383 

II.  New Section 305.7, Mold, shall be added as follows: “Where mold is found due to 384 

water damage, improper ventilation, mechanical equipment or other causes, the 385 

Code Official may require an inspection be performed by a Licensed Inspector at 386 

the cost of the property owner to determine the cause of the mold and for abatement 387 

of the causes.” 388 

 389 

JJ.  Section 307.1, General, shall read: “Handrails and guards shall comply with applicable 390 

subsections of the 2021 International Residential Code, Sections R311 and R312.” 391 

 392 

KK.  New Section 308.3.3, Screening, shall be added as follows: “All permanent dumpsters 393 

must be fully screened from public view per the standards developed by the 394 

Department of Planning.” 395 

 396 



Ordinance No. 1151 

10 Ordinance No. 1151 

T. Bourcier – 4/22/2024 

LL.  Section 505.3 Supply: Add the following to the end of the paragraph: “Disconnected 397 

water supply, due to nonpayment of the utility service to a dwelling, shall be posted 398 

with a public notice as unfit after five days without service and subject to the 399 

provisions of Section 111 of the International Property Maintenance Code. Owners 400 

of residential rental units shall not request water supply disconnection as a 401 

substitute to legal eviction proceedings.” 402 

 403 

MM.  Section 507. Storm drainage: Add the language “sump pumps” after the words 404 

“Drainage of” in the first line. 405 

 406 

NN.   Section 602.3: The dates in the fifth line shall be “September 15” and “May 31,” 407 

respectively. 408 

 409 

OO.  New Section 602.3.1, Heat substitute, shall be added as follows: “Approved portable 410 

heat supply, designed for interior use, shall be limited to a maximum of 10 days 411 

during any period of repair or replacement of the primary mechanical heat source. 412 

The Code Official may grant an extension for genuine extenuating circumstances.” 413 

 414 

PP.  Section 602.4: The dates in the third line shall be “September 15” and “May 31,” 415 

respectively. 416 

 417 

QQ.  Chapter 8: Replace the following stated codes and substitute as follows: 418 

 419 

(1) National Electrical Code — Harford County Electrical Code. 420 

(2) International Fire Code — NFPA 101 and NFPA 1. 421 

(3) International Plumbing Code — Harford County Plumbing Code. 422 

(4) International Zoning Code — City of Havre de Grace Zoning Ordinance. 423 

(5) International Fuel Gas Code — Harford County Plumbing Code 424 

 425 

RR.  Section 603.1 Mechanical Equipment and Appliances, at the end of the section add, 426 

“includes air conditioners/cooling equipment from the months of June through 427 

September.” 428 

 429 

SS.  Remove Appendix B “Board of Appeals”. 430 

 431 

 TT – Vacant, Abandoned and/or Deteriorated (VAD) Properties – Non-Residential Uses  432 

in Residential Area 433 

(1) Purpose – Due to the unregulated development of portions of the city prior to the 434 

establishment of the City Zoning Code, non-residential uses and residential uses 435 

are interspersed throughout Havre de Grace—especially in the old town.  Havre de 436 

Grace has recognized that based on several factors, VAD properties that are or were 437 

non-residential in use, which are adjacent to residential uses, can have an 438 

extraordinarily negative affect on the surrounding community that is deleterious to 439 

the health, safety and welfare of the public.  It is in the best interest of the residents 440 

and businesses of Havre de Grace to designate VAD properties and be proactive in 441 

reducing negative effects those properties have on neighborhoods, including but 442 



Ordinance No. 1151 

11 Ordinance No. 1151 

T. Bourcier – 4/22/2024 

not limited to, an unreasonable and substantial interference with the public’s use 443 

and enjoyment of public properties and protecting the health, safety and welfare of 444 

the City’s residents. 445 

(2) When a property that was non-residential in character in or adjacent to a residential 446 

zoning district is designated a VAD property, or if it is determined by the Code 447 

Official to meet any of the definitions under 111.1.5, “Dangerous, structure or 448 

premises” in the 2021 International Property Maintenance Code (IPMC), the 449 

property will be deemed unsafe. 450 

(3) The Code Official may also make a determination that a property is in VAD status 451 

citing the specific provision of the currently adopted version of the IPMC, Chapter 452 

31 of the City Code, any amendments of those ordinances, or other section of the 453 

City Code where there is a violation and the code section is relied upon in making 454 

a VAD determination.   455 

(4) The Code Official will send notice to the property owner, via Certified U.S. Mail, 456 

U.S. Mail and will physically post the property with the notice, stating the property 457 

is being considered for VAD status.  The property owner shall respond within 60 458 

days to the Code Official’s notice. 459 

(5) The Code Official’s notice will list the violations and reasons why the subject 460 

property is being considered for VAD determination, including the specific 461 

citations to the City Code, the IPMC or other law. In addition, if after inspection 462 

the Code Official determines that the structure creates an imminently dangerous 463 

condition, it shall be so stated in the Notice, together with an explanation that 464 

property may be subject to immediate demolition without further notice and with a 465 

demand for reimbursement of demolition costs to the City. 466 

(6) The property owner’s response to the Code Officer’s notice should include the 467 

following information: 468 

a. If the property is vacant, the date the property became vacant; 469 

b. Future plans for the subject property, including timeline for renovation, 470 

redevelopment and reoccupation of the subject property; 471 

c. If structures on the subject property will not be reoccupied, the property 472 

owner shall state the reasons in their response; 473 

d. If the structures on the property are recommended for demolition, the 474 

property owner should provide a timeline for demolition in their response.  475 

All demolitions must be performed per the City’s guidelines and shall 476 

include all paved and asphalted areas; 477 

e. Interim plans to abate any violations discussed in the Code Official’s notice; 478 

and 479 

f. Interim plans to make the subject structure and/or property safe. 480 

(7) If after 60 days from the date of notice, there is no response from the property owner 481 

or his/her agent, the Code Official will deem the property abandoned, and if there 482 



Ordinance No. 1151 

12 Ordinance No. 1151 

T. Bourcier – 4/22/2024 

is an additional determination by the Code Official that if the abandoned property 483 

is not only unsafe but in its current condition creates an imminent risk of death or 484 

serious bodily harm, then the City can remedy, alleviate and abate the issues in the 485 

manner mentioned in the notice.  486 

(8) In the event an owner files a response to the Notice, all action items identified under 487 

Subsections (6) (b), (d), (e), and (f) above must substantially begin within 90 days 488 

of the date the property owner’s response to the Code Official.  Upon the property 489 

owner’s written request made prior to the expiration of the 90 days, the Code 490 

Official can provide two (2) 90-day extensions for the owner to substantially begin 491 

work.  In the written extension request, the property owner shall provide: 492 

a. Facts to support the need for the extension and; 493 

b. An updated timeline describing when the owner will substantially begin and 494 

complete work. 495 

(9) In the event the work to be performed within the time limits set forth in Subsection 496 

has not begun, the Code Official will determine that such properties are VAD 497 

properties.   498 

(10) The Code Official shall send the responding owner a second notice, stating that the 499 

property has been formally declared a VAD property. The notice shall include the 500 

statement that the owner has thirty (30) days to file an appeal to the Board of 501 

Appeals pursuant to Chapter 25-Article VI of the City Code, and that a failure to 502 

appeal will result in the items set forth in subparagraphs (a) to (d) below being 503 

implemented.  Such notice shall be sent by the Code Official by Certified Mail with 504 

return receipt, US first class mail, and by posting of the property.  If no appeal is 505 

taken within the designated time, or if the Board of Appeals confirms the Code 506 

Official’s designation that the property is a VAD property, the Code Official shall 507 

take the following actions: 508 

a. All VAD properties and structures shall be posted with signage stating: 509 

“Unsafe to Occupy/No Trespassing” and further meet the requirements 510 

under 111.2 of the IPMC, Chapter 31 of City Code and other appropriate 511 

city laws. 512 

b. The Code Official reserves the right to disconnect all utilities based on 513 

Section 111.2.1 of the IPMC and other applicable City laws.  514 

c. The property owner is ordered to secure any abandoned or vacant property 515 

so that it is not deemed “dangerous”.  However, all fencing or other products 516 

should be residential in nature and meet the requirements of §205-9(I)(6), 517 

except as modified by the Department of Planning based on an examination 518 

of the surrounding neighborhood.   519 

d. If the property will not be reoccupied or redeveloped as indicated in the 520 

property owner’s response discussed in Subsection 6 above, the property 521 

owner is ordered to remove asphalt and concrete parking areas and replace 522 

it with maintainable sod, grass, native plants and other items compatible 523 



Ordinance No. 1151 

13 Ordinance No. 1151 

T. Bourcier – 4/22/2024 

with the surrounding residential character of the neighborhood at the 524 

owner’s expense. 525 

(11) Within ten (10) days of the second notice under Subparagraph 10, the property 526 

owner shall provide the Code Official access to the subject property and all 527 

structures to perform a safety and property maintenance inspection of the property. 528 

(12) While the property remains in VAD status, the property owner is required to 529 

maintain the property, landscaping and other items on the property so that it does 530 

not become dangerous, dilapidated, or detrimental to the surrounding neighborhood 531 

in manner that creates a public nuisance. 532 

(13) As part of the VAD designation and enforcement process, the Code Official 533 

reserves the right to: 534 

a. Abate any part of the property that does not meet the requirements of City 535 

Code per the proper notification requirements provided herein or other 536 

provisions of the City Code; and/or 537 

b. If the property owner does not meet the requirements of the City Code, the 538 

Code Official can issue a citation per the City Charter.  Violations of code 539 

will be considered a separate offense for each parcel and for each day the 540 

violation continues at $100.00 per day until the maximum permitted under 541 

law is met.  542 

(14) The property owner will be responsible for reimbursing the City for all costs 543 

incurred related to abatement or property maintenance.  All costs and fees are 544 

considered an ad valorem tax added to the property for purposes of calculating the 545 

property tax due. A breakdown of the calculation of costs incurred by the City for 546 

abatement or demolition is available to the owner by written request. 547 

 548 

UU.  Section 113.3 Failure to Comply, add to the end of the section:  If the Code Official, 549 

after inspection, finds that conditions on the property present imminent danger of death or 550 

serious bodily harm, he may issue an order of demolition for all or a portion of the 551 

structures on the property which shall be included in the notice provided under 552 

Subparagraph above. For all other cases, in which there is no determination that the 553 

structure poses an imminent threat of death or serious injury to person or property, then 554 

prior to the structure being demolished and removed, a hearing on the Order of Demolition 555 

will be held by the Board of Appeals per the requirements of Chapter 25 – Article IV.  The 556 

Board of Appeals will examine whether all provisions of the code have been met under its 557 

“administrative review” powers and that demolition is warranted due to the abandoned, 558 

vacant or unsafe structures being a public nuisance given the situation presented. Failure 559 

to comply with an Order of Demolition or any recommended action issued by the Code 560 

Official shall be deemed a municipal infraction subject to a daily fine of $100.00 per day 561 

for each day of non-compliance up to the maximum permitted by law. 562 

 563 

 564 

 565 



Ordinance No. 1151 

14 Ordinance No. 1151 

T. Bourcier – 4/22/2024 

C).    Section 31-3. Saving Clause. 566 

 567 

 Nothing in this Ordinance or in the International Property Maintenance Code 2021 568 

hereby adopted shall be construed to affect any existing suit or proceeding pending in any 569 

court, or any vested rights acquired, or liability incurred, or any cause or causes of action 570 

acquired or existing, under any act or ordinance hereby repealed, and any amendments 571 

thereto; nor shall any preexisting legal right or remedy of any character be lost, impaired 572 

or affected merely by the passage of this Ordinance. 573 

 574 

Article II 575 

BUILDING CODE 576 

 577 

A). Section 31-4 Adoption of the International Building Code  2021 578 

 579 

 The International Building Code 2021.  Chapters 1 through 26, 28, 30 through 35 580 

along with Appendix C, F, G, H & I as amended, as published by the International 581 

Code Council Inc., a copy of which is on file with the Department of Planning of the 582 

City of Havre de Grace, is hereby adopted by the Mayor and City Council of the City 583 

of Havre de Grace, Maryland, for the purpose of protecting the public health, safety 584 

and welfare of the citizens of the City of Havre de Grace. 585 

 586 

B).  Section 31-5 Amendments.  587 

 588 

The International Building Code 2021 shall be adopted with the following amendments: 589 

 590 

A. The name of the jurisdiction in the second line of Section 101.1 on page 1 of the 591 

International Building Code 2021 shall be “The Mayor and City Council of Havre 592 

de Grace referenced herein as the City of Havre de Grace”. 593 

 594 

B. Section 101.4.1  Replace reference to the “International Fuel Gas Code” with the 595 

“Harford County Plumbing Code”.   596 

 597 

C. Section 101.4.3 first sentence shall read as follows: “The provisions of the Harford 598 

County, Maryland Plumbing Code shall apply to the installation, alterations, repairs 599 

and replacement of plumbing systems, including equipment, appliances, fixtures, 600 

fittings, and appurtenances, and where connected to a water or sewage system and 601 

all aspects of a medical gas system.”  602 

 603 

D. Section 101.4.5 shall read as follows: “The provisions of the State of Maryland Fire 604 

Prevention Code shall apply to matters affecting or relating to structures, processes 605 

and premises from the hazard of fire and explosion arising from the storage, 606 

handling or use of structures, materials or devices; from conditions hazardous to 607 

life, property or public welfare in the occupancy of structures or premises; and from 608 

the construction, extension, repair, alteration or removal of fire suppression and 609 

alarm systems or fire hazards in the structure or on the premises from occupancy or 610 

operation.”  611 



Ordinance No. 1151 

15 Ordinance No. 1151 

T. Bourcier – 4/22/2024 

 612 

E. Add a new Section 101.4.8 Electrical.  “The provisions of the Harford County, 613 

Maryland Electrical Code, Chapter 105 of the Harford County Code, shall apply to 614 

the installation, alterations, repairs and replacement of electrical systems.” 615 

  616 

F. Section 102.6:  Reference to the “International Fire Code” shall be changed to the 617 

“State of Maryland Fire Prevention Code” and NFPA 101 and NFPA 1, and 618 

reference to the International Property Maintenance Code shall be as amended by 619 

this Code. 620 

 621 

G.    Section 103 shall be entitled "Division of Inspection Services"; and Section 103.1 622 

shall read as follows: “Creation of Enforcement Agency. The Director of The 623 

Department of Planning or the Director’s designee is hereby designated as the 624 

Building Official or Code Official and shall be in charge of all matters related to 625 

building and property inspections.” 626 

 627 

H. Add a new Section 104.12 Restriction of Employees:  “An official or employee 628 

connected with the Department of Planning shall not be engaged in or directly or 629 

indirectly connected with the furnishing of labor, materials or appliances for the 630 

construction, alteration or maintenance of a building, or the preparation of 631 

construction documents thereof, unless that person is the owner of the building; nor 632 

shall such officer or employee engage in any work that conflicts with official duties 633 

or with the interests of the Department.”    634 

 635 

I. Section 105.1 Required.  Add to the end of the section the following: “A 636 

commercial Use & Occupancy permit will be required for any change in ownership 637 

and/or tenancy.”  A use and occupancy permit for residential rental property (short-638 

term or long-term) will be required prior to the start of a new tenancy after a change 639 

in ownership for any property issued a permit after the effective date of this 640 

Chapter. 641 

 642 

J. Section 105.1.1 Annual Permit shall be deleted. 643 

 644 

K. Section 105.1.2 Annual Permit Records shall be deleted. 645 

 646 

L.    Section 105.2 Work Exempt from Permit shall be deleted.   647 

 648 

M. Section 105.2.2 is deleted and replaced with the following: “Repairs.  Application 649 

or notice to the Building Official is not required for ordinary repairs to structures.  650 

Such repairs shall not include the cutting away of any wall, partition or portion 651 

thereof, the removal or cutting of any structural beam or load-bearing support, or 652 

the removal or change of any required means of egress, or rearrangement of parts 653 

of a structure affecting the egress requirements, or other work affecting public 654 

health or general safety.” 655 

 656 



Ordinance No. 1151 

16 Ordinance No. 1151 

T. Bourcier – 4/22/2024 

N. Section 105.3 Application of Permit is amended by adding “or electronically” after 657 

the word “writing” in the second line. 658 

 659 

O. Add a new Section 105.3.3 Abatement of Uncompleted Structures. In the event that 660 

the responsible party fails to complete construction of a structure after 180 days of 661 

abandonment, or revocation of the building permit, and in the event that the 662 

responsible party fails to comply with the lawful order of the Director or the 663 

Director's designee to make safe by the completion of the construction or to 664 

demolish an unsafe and uncompleted structure, the Director or the Director's 665 

designee shall cause emergency work to be completed as required, to abate the 666 

unsafe conditions by appropriate means, including the demolition and removal of 667 

dangerous structures, using such public or private resources required and available.   668 

 669 

P. Add a new Section 105.3.4, Abatement of Unsafe Conditions. When, in the opinion 670 

of the Director or the Director's designee, there is an imminent danger to human 671 

life or the public welfare due to an unsafe condition, the Director or the Director's 672 

designee shall cause the necessary work to be done to eliminate the condition 673 

including, but not limited to, the demolition of the structure or structures. The 674 

Director or the Director's designee shall cause to be published, for three (3) 675 

consecutive days, in a County newspaper of record, notice setting forth the address 676 

of the building; a description of the real estate sufficient for its identification; a 677 

statement that the property is unsafe and constitutes an immediate and continuing 678 

hazard to the community; and a statement that the City intends to demolish same if 679 

the owner fails to do so. A person objecting to the proposed actions of the City may 680 

file an objection in an appropriate form in a court of competent jurisdiction. If the 681 

building is not demolished within thirty (30) days of mailing notice to the owners 682 

of record, or within thirty (30) days of the last day of publication of the notice in a 683 

County newspaper of record, whichever is later, the Director or the Director's 684 

designee shall have the power to demolish the structure or structures. 685 

 686 

Q. Add a new Section 105.3.5, Creation of a Tax Lien. There is created a tax lien on 687 

real property for monies expended by the City for the making safe of buildings or 688 

structures and/or abatement of other unsafe nuisances or conditions constituting a 689 

danger to the public health and safety. The amount of such lien shall be collected 690 

by the Director of Finance in the same manner as other City real estate taxes. 691 

 692 

R.   Section 105.5 Expiration: shall read as follows “A permit shall be deemed to be 693 

expired if the work on the site authorized by said permit is not commenced within 694 

180 days after its issuance. The Building Official may grant one (1) extension for a 695 

period of ninety (90) days to commence work on the site if requested in writing and 696 

showing justifiable cause prior to permit expiration. 697 

 698 

S. Add a new Section 105.5.1 Void:  “Any permit which has been applied for and not 699 

issued within 180 days of application, and which no work has begun shall be 700 

deemed void.  No refunds will be issued on any permits, unless the permit has been 701 

cancelled in writing by the applicant within 30 (thirty) days of date of original 702 



Ordinance No. 1151 

17 Ordinance No. 1151 

T. Bourcier – 4/22/2024 

application, less a $100.00 administrative fee, or permit fee, whichever is less.  In 703 

no case will water and sewer cost recovery fees be refunded or transferred.”  704 

 705 

T. Add a new Section 105.5.2 Incomplete:  If the work authorized on the site by such 706 

permit has commenced, but is suspended or abandoned for a period of 180 707 

consecutive days after the work is commenced, and the structure is left in an unsafe 708 

condition, see Sections 105.3.3 and 105.3.4 above.  If all building and trades 709 

inspections have not received final approval, the City may attach the permit record 710 

to tax records as a lien on the property until all required inspections have been 711 

approved and the permit file is closed.  712 

 713 

U. Section 105.6 Suspension or revocation is amended by adding the following to the 714 

end of the section:  “Any permit may be suspended or revoked for illegal 715 

occupancy, or construction activities outside the scope of application for a period 716 

of 90 days, provided the structure is not left in an unsafe condition.  No work may 717 

proceed during the 90-day period until the reason for suspension or revocation is 718 

addressed by re-applying, or submitting revised building plans based on current 719 

building codes.  See also all previous 105 Sections as applicable.” 720 

 721 

V. Add a new Section 105.6.1 Withholding Permits.  The Building Official may 722 

withhold the issuance of any permit and/or place a hold on inspections if the 723 

applicant, the property owner, or any other individual or entity listed on the 724 

application has failed to remedy or correct any existing/alleged violation of the City 725 

Code for other properties within the City’s jurisdiction, which a final inspection 726 

approval has not been granted. 727 

 728 

W. Section 105.7 Placement of Permit shall read as follows:  “The building permit or 729 

copy shall be kept on the site of the work, and displayed in plain view where 730 

appropriate, until the completion of the project and final inspections are approved.” 731 

  732 

X. Section 109.2 shall read as follows: Building Permit Fees: "Fees for permits shall 733 

be based upon the valuation of staff time required to execute plan examinations, 734 

permit reviews and site inspections and shall be established by the Mayor and City 735 

Council from time to time." 736 

 737 

Y. Section 109.3 is amended by deleting the last two sentences of the section. 738 

 739 

Z. Section 109.4 Work commencing before permit issuance: shall read as follows: 740 

“Any person who demolishes any building or structure, or commences any work 741 

on a building, structure or property, or opens a new business before obtaining the  742 

necessary permits shall be subject to a fee equal to double the required permit fee, 743 

and may be guilty of a municipal infraction or a misdemeanor. If the permit is not 744 

applied for with the appropriate fees paid within 10 days of documented 745 

notification, the property owner shall be subject to an additional fine equal to the 746 

required permit fees for each 30-day period the permit is not applied for, not to 747 

exceed $1,000.00, and shall be collected as ad valorem taxes.” 748 



Ordinance No. 1151 

18 Ordinance No. 1151 

T. Bourcier – 4/22/2024 

 749 

AA.  New Section 110.1.1 “Approval of Inspections or Permits” shall be added as 750 

follows: “Any inspection or permit approval provided by the City, or by Harford 751 

County on the City’s behalf, is not a warranty of construction or workmanship. New 752 

permit applications may be placed on hold if the applicant, contractor, or property 753 

owner has open permits or incomplete inspections related to work on other 754 

properties within the City’s municipal jurisdiction owned or controlled by such 755 

applicant, contractor, or property owner that are not compliant with City 756 

Administrative procedures and policies, as determined by the Director.” 757 

  758 

BB.  New Section 110.7 “Standards” shall be added as follows:  “All buildings, 759 

structures and appurtenances thereto shall be constructed strictly in compliance 760 

with accepted engineering practices.  All members and components of the structure 761 

shall be installed, fitted or fastened, moved or stored in such a manner that the full 762 

structural capabilities of the members are obtained.  Improper alignment (level and 763 

square), fitting, fastening or methods of construction shall be considered a violation 764 

of this Code.”   765 

 766 

CC. Section 111.2 Use and Occupancy Certificate Issued shall read as follows: “The 767 

Building Official, or designee, shall sign and date the office copy of the Permit 768 

Application and Zoning Certificate for Use and Occupancy upon completion and 769 

approval of all required inspections for which the permit was applied for.  A copy 770 

of the certificate with the Use and Occupancy approval shall be made available to 771 

the applicant.” 772 

 773 

DD. Section 111.3 is amended by adding the following at the end of the section:  “Any 774 

person, firm or corporation engaged in the process of selling property in which a 775 

temporary Certificate of Occupancy is issued shall at the time of settlement present 776 

to the buyer a copy of the temporary Certificate of Occupancy which must include 777 

a list of deficiencies that remain to be corrected or conditions that must be met prior 778 

to the issuance of the final Certificate. 779 

 780 

EE. Section 112.1 shall be amended by replacing the “Department of Building Safety” 781 

with the “Department of Public Works”, deleting the words “this code” and adding 782 

the words “the County Code or other City codes” following the phrase, “regulated 783 

by”.  Prior to the end of the sentence add “or by the Director of Public Works or 784 

their designee”. 785 

 786 

FF. Section 112.2 shall be amended by adding the words “The Director of Public Works 787 

or their designee, or” to the beginning of the section. 788 

 789 

GG. Section 112.3 shall be amended by adding the words “The Director of Public Works 790 

or their designee, or” after the words “building official” throughout the secion. 791 

 792 

HH.     Section 113.1 Board of Appeals-General shall read as follows: “Any person affected 793 

by any decision or notice which has been issued by the City in connection with the 794 



Ordinance No. 1151 

19 Ordinance No. 1151 

T. Bourcier – 4/22/2024 

enforcement of any provision of this Code, or of any rule or regulation adopted 795 

pursuant hereto, or any person who desires to appeal a decision made pursuant 796 

hereto, or who requests a variance from the terms hereof, or who requests an 797 

interpretation of the terms hereof, may file an appropriate application with the 798 

Board of Appeals of the City of Havre de Grace in accordance with the Board of 799 

Appeals Ordinance contained in the Codified Ordinances of the Mayor and City 800 

Council.” 801 

 802 

II.        Board of Appeals Sections  113.2 through 113.3 are deleted. 803 

 804 

JJ.       Section  114.4 Violation penalties shall read as follows:  805 

 806 

 “a.  Any person who shall be adjudged to have (1) violated any of the provisions of 807 

this Ordinance; or (2) failed to comply herewith or permitted or maintained such a 808 

violation; or (3) violated or failed to comply with any order made hereunder; or (4) 809 

to have built in violation of any details, statements, specifications or plans 810 

submitted or approved hereunder; or (5) failed to operate in accordance with the 811 

provisions of any certificate, permit, or approval issued hereunder, shall severally 812 

for each violation and noncompliance respectively, be guilty of a municipal 813 

infraction, for which a fine not to exceed $1,000.00 may be imposed for each such 814 

infraction, payable to the City of Havre de Grace, with costs imposed in the 815 

discretion of the court. Each day that an infraction continues after notice has been 816 

served shall be deemed a separate infraction. The imposition of a fine for any 817 

violation shall not excuse the violation nor shall the violation be permitted to 818 

continue. Prosecution or lack thereof of either the owner, occupant, or the person 819 

in charge shall not be deemed to relieve any of the others. 820 

 821 

 b.   Any person who shall be convicted of willfully (1) violating any of the 822 

provisions of this Ordinance; or (2) failing to comply herewith or permitting or 823 

maintaining such a violation; or (3) violating or failing to comply with any order 824 

made hereunder; or (4) building in violation of any details, statements, 825 

specifications or plans submitted or approved hereunder; or (5) failing to operate in 826 

accordance with the provisions of any certificate, permit, or approval issued 827 

hereunder, shall severally for each violation and noncompliance respectively, be 828 

guilty of a misdemeanor, punishable by a fine not exceeding $1,000.00 and 829 

imprisonment not exceeding ninety (90) days for each violation, with costs imposed 830 

in the discretion of the court. Each day that a violation continues after notice has 831 

been served shall be deemed a separate offence. The imposition of punishment for 832 

any violation shall not excuse the violation nor shall the violation be permitted to 833 

continue. Prosecution or lack thereof of either the owner, occupant, or the person 834 

in charge shall not be deemed to relieve any of the others. 835 

 836 

 c.   Any order or notice issued or served as provided in this Ordinance shall be 837 

complied with by the owner, operator, occupant or other person responsible for the 838 

condition or violation to which the order or notice pertains. Every order or notice 839 

shall set forth a time limit for compliance dependent upon the hazard and danger 840 



Ordinance No. 1151 

20 Ordinance No. 1151 

T. Bourcier – 4/22/2024 

created by the violation. In cases of extreme danger to persons or property 841 

immediate compliance shall be required.  If the notice of violation is not complied 842 

with, the Code Official shall institute the appropriate proceeding at law or in equity 843 

to restrain, correct or abate such violation, or to require the removal or termination 844 

of the unlawful occupancy of the structure in violation of the provisions of this 845 

Code or of the order or direction made pursuant thereto. 846 

 847 

 d.   In addition to the other provisions set out in this Ordinance, the City of Havre 848 

de Grace may institute injunctive, declaratory or any other appropriate action or 849 

proceedings at law or equity for the enforcement of the International Building Code  850 

2021 or to correct violations of the International Building Code 2021, and any court 851 

of competent jurisdiction has the right to issue restraining orders, temporary or 852 

permanent injunctions or declaration of rights or other appropriate forms of remedy 853 

or relief. 854 

 855 

 e.  All provisions of Article 23A, Section 3, of the Annotated Code of Maryland 856 

relating to municipal infractions are incorporated in this chapter. In the event of any 857 

inconsistency between this Section 114.4 and Article 23A, Section 3, the provisions 858 

in Article 23A, Section 3 shall prevail.” 859 

 860 

KK.     Section 115.2 Issuance shall read as follows:  At the end of the first sentence, add 861 

the following phrase “or posted conspicuously on the property.” 862 

 863 

LL. Section 115.3 shall be amended by adding the words “or the Director of Public 864 

Works or their designee” following the phrase “the building official” throughout 865 

the section. 866 

 867 

 MM.   Section  115.4  Failure to comply, shall read as follows: “Any person who shall 868 

continue any work after having been served with a stop work order, except such 869 

work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, 870 

shall be subject to the penalties and fines set forth in this Code.”     871 

               872 

           NN.      Add a new section:  Section 116.6 Abatement: “If a person who has been issued an 873 

order under this section fails, within the time limit specified in a notice of violation 874 

or order, to abate the unsafe condition or violation as directed, the Department of 875 

Planning or Department of Public Works may take whatever abatement action that 876 

may be necessary by use of City employees and equipment and/or by contract with 877 

private contractors.  The cost and expense of abating the unsafe condition shall be 878 

certified by the Department of Planning or Department of Public Works.  These 879 

charges shall constitute a lien upon the real property and shall be collectible in the 880 

same manner as real property taxes with the same priority, interest and penalties.  881 

Initiation of abatement action shall not preclude the commencement of any other 882 

action or legal proceedings authorized or permitted under this Code, the laws of the 883 

State of Maryland and the common law.”  884 

 885 



Ordinance No. 1151 

21 Ordinance No. 1151 

T. Bourcier – 4/22/2024 

 OO. Section 308.5.1 is amended by adding the following exception:  “Exception:  A 886 

childcare facility may be classified as I-4 when the facility is classified as a day 887 

care occupancy under the State Fire Prevention Code.” 888 

 889 

 PP. Section 406.2.7 is amended by deleting “Section 1107” and replacing it with “The 890 

Maryland Accessibility Code, Comar 09.12.53”. 891 

 892 

 QQ. Section 411.5 is amended by deleting item 3 and replacing with the following: “3. 893 

All exits and exit access doors from each puzzle room shall be open and readily 894 

available upon activation by the automatic fire alarm system, automatic sprinkler 895 

system, a manual control at a constantly attended location and shall have a readily 896 

accessible control located inside each puzzle room.” 897 

 898 

 RR. Section 502.1 is amended by adding “undergoing renovations that require the 899 

issuance of a building permit” following “New and existing buildings” in the first 900 

line. 901 

 902 

 SS. Add a new Section 511, Electrical Energy Storage Systems: “511.1 Electrical 903 

Energy Storage Systems.  Electrical energy storage systems shall be regulated by 904 

the provisions contained in the International Fire Code.” 905 

 906 

 TT.      Section 903.2.1.2 is amended by substituting “300” for “100” in item 2 between the 907 

words “of” and “or”. 908 

 909 

 UU. Section 907.2.1.1 is amended by deleting “1000” in the section heading between 910 

the words “of” and “or”, and also in the second line between the words “of” and 911 

“or”, and replacing both with “300”. 912 

 913 

 VV. Section 1004.8 is amended by adding the words “nail salons” between the words  914 

  “centers” and “trading” in the third line. 915 

 916 

 WW.  Section 1020.1 is amended by adding the following exception:  “6. Corridors 917 

contained within a single tenant space.” 918 

 919 

XX.     Chapter 11 Accessibility is deleted in its entirety and is replaced with the Maryland 920 

Accessibility Code set forth in COMAR  09.12.53 et. seq. 921 

  922 

YY.     Section 1502.4 Gutters: Add to the existing section: "Gutters and downspouts shall 923 

be provided on all roofed structures having a horizontal building plane area 924 

exceeding 240 square feet. They shall be sized to accommodate run off from the 925 

roof area, and in accordance with manufacturer's specifications. Storm water outfall 926 

from downspouts shall not be discharged in a manner that detrimentally impacts 927 

adjoining properties.” 928 

 929 



Ordinance No. 1151 

22 Ordinance No. 1151 

T. Bourcier – 4/22/2024 

ZZ.      Add a new section:  Section 1503.6: "Drip Edge: "Non-corrosive roof edging shall 930 

be provided at roof edges and shall cover the upper edges of the roof sheathing and 931 

fascia." 932 

 933 

AAA.  Figure 1608.2 is amended by adding the following note:  “The ground snow load, 934 

pg, for Harford County, Maryland shall be 30 psf. 935 

 936 

BBB.   Section 1612.3 Establishment of Flood Hazard Area: shall be deleted: (See the City 937 

of Havre de Grace Floodplain Ordinance.) 938 

 939 

CCC.  Section 1809.5 Frost Protection is amended by deleting method 1 and inserting in 940 

lieu thereof: “1. Extending below the frost line established as 30” below final 941 

grade.” 942 

 943  944 
 DDD. Add a new subsection 3001.1.1:   Maryland State Elevator Code.  The provisions 945 

of this code are in addition to the requirements in the Maryland State Elevator Code.  946 

If a conflict between this code and the state code exists, the requirements in the 947 

state code shall apply. 948 

 949 

EEE.   Section 3103.1.2 Permit Required shall read: “Permits shall be required for 950 

temporary structures in accordance with applicable codes.”   951 

 952 

FFF.  New Section 3109.2 “Pool Installation” shall be added as follows:  Any pool 953 

installation requiring grading or excavation as part of the installation will be 954 

required to erect silt fencing completely around the area to be graded or excavated.  955 

No fill or excavated material shall be distributed or placed in a manner which would 956 

affect storm water runoff to neighboring properties. 957 

 958 

GGG. Section 3201.3 Other Laws:   Second sentence shall be added as follows: “No 959 

 encroachment into the Public Right-of-Way for construction or installation of any 960 

 structure may take place without prior approval by the Mayor and City Council.”  961 

 962 

HHH. Section 3201.4 Drainage shall read: “Drainage water collected from a roof, awning, 963 

canopy or marquee, foundation drains, sump pump, fresh water ground springs 964 

resulting from new construction or grading, and condensation from mechanical 965 

equipment shall not flow over a public walking surface.” 966 

 967 

III.       Section 3202.3.3  Encroachments 15 feet or more above grade:   shall  be  968 

     deleted. 969 

 970 

JJJ.      Add a new section:  Section 3301.3 Housekeeping:  “Rubbish and trash shall not be 971 

allowed to accumulate on construction sites or other premises and shall be stored 972 

in approved secured containers and removed as soon as conditions warrant.  973 

Combustible rubbish shall be removed promptly and shall not be disposed of by 974 

burning on the premises or within City Limits.  Unused or discarded construction 975 

materials must be removed from the construction site immediately following 976 



Ordinance No. 1151 

23 Ordinance No. 1151 

T. Bourcier – 4/22/2024 

project completion or when a permit is void.  Vegetation and weeds shall be 977 

properly maintained in accordance with the IPMC.”   978 

 979 

KKK. Add a new section:  Section 3301.4 Site Conditions:  “Whenever the Code Official, 980 

or Director of Public Works, finds any work regulated by City Code is being 981 

performed in a manner contrary to its provisions, or for improper or unlawful site 982 

conditions, or work performed in a dangerous or unsafe manner, the Code Official 983 

or Director of Public Works is authorized to issue a Stop Work Order and issue 984 

fines as appropriate for the condition of concern.” 985 

 986 

LLL. Add a new section:  Section 3302.5 Vehicle Access:  “Development of 5 (five) or 987 

more residential lots, or commercial development sites, are required to have 988 

unobstructed vehicle access through the site at all times until construction is 989 

completed and site is stabilized. 990 

 991 

MMM.  Appendices A, B, D, E, H and J shall be deleted. 992 

  993 

NNN.  Appendix G: Flood Resistant Construction: In case of conflicts, the order of 994 

compliance is Federal Emergency Management Agency Regulation, Maryland 995 

Department of the Environment Regulation, City of Havre de Grace Ordinances, 996 

and Appendix G last.   997 

 998 

C).  Section 31-6.  Saving Clause. 999 

 1000 

 Nothing in this Ordinance or in the International Building Code 2021 hereby 1001 

adopted shall be construed to affect any existing suit or proceeding pending in any court, 1002 

or any vested rights acquired, or liability incurred, or any cause or causes of action acquired 1003 

or existing, under any act or ordinance hereby repealed, and any amendments thereto; nor 1004 

shall any preexisting legal right or remedy of any character be lost, impaired or affected 1005 

merely by the passage of this Ordinance. 1006 

 1007 

Article III 1008 

RESIDENTIAL CODE 1009 

 1010 

A).  Section 31-7 Adoption of the 2021 International Residential Code for One and Two Family 1011 

Dwellings. 1012 

   1013 

 The International Residential Code for One and Two Family Dwellings 2021 as 1014 

published by the International Code Council, Inc., Chapters 1 through 23, 42 and 44, 1015 

Section P2904, and Appendices AA through AE, AG, AH, AJ, AK as amended through 1016 

2021, a copy of which is on file with the Department of Planning of the City of Havre de 1017 

Grace, is hereby adopted by the Mayor and City Council of the City of Havre de Grace, 1018 

Maryland, for the purpose of protecting the health, safety and welfare of the citizens of the 1019 

City of Havre de Grace. 1020 

 1021 

B).  Section 31-8. Amendments.   1022 



Ordinance No. 1151 

24 Ordinance No. 1151 

T. Bourcier – 4/22/2024 

  1023 

The International Residential Code for One and Two Family Dwellings 2021 shall 1024 

be adopted with the following amendments: 1025 

 1026 

A. The name of the jurisdiction in the second line of R101.1 Title, on page 1-1 of the 1027 

International Residential Code for One and Two Family Dwellings 2021 shall be 1028 

“The Mayor and City Council of Havre de Grace referred to herein as the City of 1029 

Havre de Grace”. 1030 

 1031 

B. Add a new section:  Section R101.4 Safeguards During Construction:  “The 1032 

provisions of Chapter 33 of the 2021 International Building Code, as amended, 1033 

shall be applicable to all construction. A valid building permit is required.”    1034 

 1035 

C. Section R102.7 Existing Structures: References to the International Fire Code shall 1036 

be changed to the “State of Maryland Fire Prevention Code”.      1037 

 1038 

D. Sections R103 through R114 are deleted and Sections 103 through 116 of the 2021 1039 

International Building Code, as amended, shall apply.      1040 

 1041 

E. Section R202 Building definition is amended by deleting the last sentence. 1042 

 1043 

F. Section R202 Fire Separation Distance definition shall be amended as follows:  add 1044 

new item 4. To an exclusive use easement line. 1045 

 1046 

G. Section R202 Manufactured Home definition shall be amended as follows:  in the 1047 

7th line delete “or without” and delete the last two sentences of the definition.  1048 

 1049 

           H. Table R301.2 shall read as follows: 1050 

 Ground Snow Load:           30 lbs 1051 

 Wind Speed:            90 mph 1052 

 Topographic Effects:           No 1053 

 Special wind region:                  No 1054 

 Wind-borne debris zone:                  No 1055 

 Seismic Design Category:         A-B 1056 

 Weathering:           Severe 1057 

 Frost Line Depth:       30 inches 1058 

 Termite:        Moderate to Heavy 1059 

 Winter Design Temp.:                 13 Degrees F 1060 

 Ice Barrier Underlayment:      No 1061 

 Flood Hazards:    FIRM Date  04/19/2016 1062 

 Air Freezing Index:       645   1063 

 Mean Annual Temp.:                 53.2 Degrees F   1064 

 1065 

 I. Add Section R302.1.1 Balconies and Decks on Townhomes:  “All portions of 1066 

balconies and decks on townhomes constructed of combustible materials shall not 1067 

be located closer than 24 inches (609.6 mm) to any property line.”     1068 



Ordinance No. 1151 

25 Ordinance No. 1151 

T. Bourcier – 4/22/2024 

 1069 

 J. TABLES R302.1(1) AND R302.1(2) SHALL HAVE THE FOLLOWING LINE 1070 

ADDED TO THE BOTTOM OF EACH TABLE: 1071 

   1072 
ALL PORTIONS OF ATTACHED DECKS 

AND OPEN ROOF COVERED DECKS.  

OPEN ROOF COVERED DECKS MAY 

HAVE A MAXIMUM OPAQUE WALL 

SURFACE AREA OF 50% 

NOT 

ALLOWED 

N/A <2 FEET 

 1073 

 K. Add a new section:  Section R312.1.1.1 Areaway Guards: “A guardrail or other 1074 

approved barrier shall be installed on areaway walls with a grade level elevation 1075 

difference of greater than 48 inches (1219.2 mm).  Guards shall be constructed in 1076 

accordance with Section R312.” 1077 

 1078 

 L. New subsection 327.2 is added as follows:  “326.3 Grading.  Inground 1079 

 swimming pools require silt fencing to be installed around work area.  Final 1080 

 grading cannot impact storm water runoff onto neighboring properties. 1081 

 Excavated material to be removed from property.” 1082 

    1083 

 M. Section R405.1 is amended by deleting the exception at the end of the section.  1084 

 1085 

 N. Section R506.2.2 is amended by deleting the exception at the end of the section.          1086 

 1087 

 O. Add Section  R703.9.3 Special Inspections:  “Special inspections shall be required 1088 

for all EIFS applications. 1089 

  Exceptions: 1090 

  1.  Special inspections shall not be required for EIFS applications installed over a 1091 

water-resistive barrier with a means of draining moisture to the exterior. 1092 

  2.   Special inspections shall not be required for EIFS applications installed over 1093 

masonry or concrete walls.”     1094 

 1095 

 P. Add Section R903.4.2 Gutters and Leaders:  “Gutters and leaders shall be installed 1096 

in accordance with the Harford County Plumbing Code.   1097 

 1098 

O. Chapter 11 is deleted in its entirety and the 2021 International Energy Conservation 1099 

Code as adopted in Article IV is inserted in lieu thereof.  1100 

 1101 

C).    Section 31-9. Saving Clause. 1102 

 1103 

Nothing in this Ordinance or in the International Residential Code for One and Two Family 1104 

Dwellings 2021 hereby adopted shall be construed to affect any existing suit or proceeding 1105 

pending in any court, or any vested rights acquired, or liability incurred, or any cause or 1106 

causes of action acquired or existing, under any act or ordinance hereby repealed, and any 1107 

amendments thereto; nor shall any preexisting legal right or remedy of any character be 1108 

lost, impaired or affected merely by the passage of this Ordinance. 1109 

 1110 

Article IV 1111 



Ordinance No. 1151 

26 Ordinance No. 1151 

T. Bourcier – 4/22/2024 

ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE 1112 

 1113 

A) Section 31-10 Adoption of the International Energy Conservation Code 2021 1114 

 1115 

The International Energy Conservation Code, as amended, as published by the International Code 1116 

Council Inc., a copy of which is on file with the Department of Planning of the City of Havre de 1117 

Grace, is hereby adopted by the Mayor and City Council of the City of Havre de Grace, Maryland, 1118 

for the purpose of protecting the public health, safety and welfare of the citizens of the City of 1119 

Havre de Grace. 1120 

 1121 

B) Section 31-11 Amendments 1122 

 1123 

The International Energy Conservation Code 2021 shall be adopted with the following 1124 

amendments. 1125 

 1126 

A. The name of the jurisdiction in the second line of Section C101.1 shall be “The 1127 

Mayor and City Council of Havre de Grace referred to herein as the City of 1128 

Havre de Grace”. 1129 

 1130 

B. Sections C103 through C110 are deleted and replaced by appropriate sections 1131 

within Article II of this code. 1132 

 1133 

C. Section C202 is amended by adding the following definitions:  1134 

 1135 

1. HOTEL.  Means an establishment that offers sleeping accommodations 1136 

for compensation with the exception of a bed and breakfast 1137 

establishment as defined under the City Code. 1138 

2. MASTER CONTROL DEVISE.  Means a control that is activated when 1139 

a person enters the room through the primary room access method; or 1140 

an occupancy sensor control that is activated by a person’s presence in 1141 

the room. 1142 

 1143 

D. New Section C405.2.1.5 Hotel Guest Rooms; “Each hotel guest room shall be 1144 

equipped with a master control device that automatically turns off the power to 1145 

all of the lighting fixtures in the guest room no more than 30 minutes after the 1146 

room has been vacated. 1147 

 1148 

E. Section R101.1 is amended by inserting “The City of Havre de Grace” in the            1149 

second line for the Name of Jurisdiction. 1150 

 1151 

F. Section R102.1.1 is amended by adding the following at the end of the section: 1152 

“Compliance with the silver rating of the ICC 700 NGBS as codified in the 1153 

Annotated Code of Maryland Public Safety Article §12-509(A).” 1154 

 1155 



Ordinance No. 1151 

27 Ordinance No. 1151 

T. Bourcier – 4/22/2024 

G. Sections R103 through R110 of the 2021 International Energy Conservation 1156 

Code are deleted and replaced by appropriate sections within Article II of this 1157 

Code. 1158 

 1159 

H. Section R401.2.5 is amended by adding the following after item number 3: “4. 1160 

For buildings complying with Section R402.1.3.1, the structure shall also 1161 

comply with the additional energy features of Section N1108.3.” 1162 

 1163 

I. New Section R402.1.3.1 Maryland Alternative R-Value: “Assemblies with an 1164 

R-value of insulation materials equal to or greater than that specified in Table 1165 

R402.1.3.1 shall be an alternative to the U-factor in Table R402.1.2 when 1166 

combined with Section R408.3.  The provision of Section R408.2.1 shall be 1167 

applied to the base model house to establish the reference base design 1168 

establishing energy efficiency. 1169 

 1170 
 1171 

J. Section R402.2.1 is amended by adding “or Section R402.1.3.1” between 1172 

“R402.1.3” and “requires” in the second and seventh line. 1173 

 1174 

K. Section R402.2.2 is amended by adding “or Section R402.1.3.1” between 1175 

“R402.1.3” and “requires” in the second and eleventh line. 1176 

 1177 

L. New Section R408.3 Maryland Alternative Additional Energy Efficiency 1178 

Package Options: “The provisions of this section shall be applied as part of the 1179 

prescriptive compliance path of Section R402.1.3.1.  Additional energy 1180 

efficiencies from Table R408.3 must be selected to meet or exceed a minimum 1181 

percentage increase of 6%. 1182 

 1183 



Ordinance No. 1151 

28 Ordinance No. 1151 

T. Bourcier – 4/22/2024 

 1184 

 1185 
C).    Section 31-12. Saving Clause. 1186 

 1187 

          Nothing in this Ordinance or in the International Energy Conservation Code 2021 1188 

hereby adopted shall be construed to affect any existing suit or proceeding pending in any 1189 



Ordinance No. 1151 

29 Ordinance No. 1151 

T. Bourcier – 4/22/2024 

court, or any vested rights acquired, or liability incurred, or any cause or causes of action 1190 

acquired or existing, under any act or ordinance hereby repealed, and any amendments 1191 

thereto; nor shall any preexisting legal right or remedy of any character be lost, impaired 1192 

or affected merely by the passage of this Ordinance. 1193 

 1194 

Article V 1195 

VIOLATION COST 1196 

 1197 

A).          Section 31-12.  Costs Incurred By City. 1198 

 1199 

Any and all  fees, charges, services, and other costs incurred by the City to restrain, 1200 

correct or abate a violation of this Ordinance, or to prevent illegal occupancy of a 1201 

building, structure or premises, or to stop an illegal act, conduct, business or 1202 

utilization of the building, structure or premises in violation of this Ordinance, 1203 

including but not limited to attorney fees, surveying costs, engineering costs (the 1204 

“Violation Costs”), shall be the responsibility of, and payable by the owner of the 1205 

property on which the violation occurred, to the City of Havre de Grace (the “City”) 1206 

upon receipt of a written itemized invoice from the City for such costs. The invoice 1207 

shall be sent by hand delivery or by regular mail, certified mail, or by posting the 1208 

property.  A late charge equal to 1.5% per month shall be added to any amount 1209 

unpaid and outstanding thirty (30) days after billing until the outstanding amount 1210 

is paid in full. Unless paid on time, the Violation Costs and interest shall be placed 1211 

on the said property owner’s City property tax bill. The said property owner shall 1212 

pay all collection costs, including the City’s actual attorney fees, should the City 1213 

engage the services of any attorney to collect any unpaid such charges. All 1214 

Violation Costs, interest, and collection costs thereon shall be chargeable against 1215 

the property on which the violation occurred, and shall be collected and secured in 1216 

the same manner as general ad valorem taxes and shall be subject to the same 1217 

penalties and the same procedure, sale and lien priority in case of delinquency, as 1218 

is provided for general ad valorem taxes. An administrative fee shall be added to 1219 

the lien for processing of the lien procedure.  1220 

 1221 

BE IT FURTHER ENACTED AND ORDAINED THAT ALL PRIOR ORDINANCES AND 1222 

RESOLUTIONS INCONSISTENT HEREWITH, ARE HEREBY REPEALED TO THE 1223 

EXTENT OF THE INCONSISTENCY, BUT IN ALL OTHER RESPECTS SHALL 1224 

REMAIN IN FULL FORCE AND EFFECT. 1225 

 1226 

ADOPTED by the City Council of Havre de Grace, Maryland this __ day of _____, 2024. 1227 

 1228 

SIGNED by the Mayor and attested by the Director of Administration this ____ day of ________, 1229 

2024. 1230 

[Signatures to follow on the next page.] 1231 

ATTEST: MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL 1232 

 OF HAVRE DE GRACE 1233 

 1234 

    1235 



Ordinance No. 1151 

30 Ordinance No. 1151 

T. Bourcier – 4/22/2024 

Christopher Ricci William T. Martin 1236 

Director of Administration Mayor 1237 

 1238 

 1239 

Introduced/First Reading: 5/6/2024 1240 

Public Hearing:   1241 

Second Reading/Adopted:  1242 

 1243 

Effective Date:   1244 

 1245 

Legislative History 1246 

Ordinance No. 975, As Amended, enacted December 7, 2015 1247 

Ordinance No. 1009, As Amended, enacted August 20, 2018 1248 

Ordinance No. 1030, As Amended, enacted March 16, 2020 1249 

Ordinance No. 1125, As Amended, enacted November 6, 2023 1250 

Ordinance No. 1136, As Amended, enacted January 16, 2024 1251 


	Check Box1: Off
	Check Box2: Yes
	Check Box3: Yes
	Check Box4: Off


